

The School Board of Broward County, Florida
Procurement & Warehousing Services

ITB No.: 15-077B Tentative Board Meeting Date*: FEBRUARY 18, 2015
 Description: CAN LINERS AND COMPACTOR BAGS Notified: 336 Downloaded: 28
 ITB Rec'd: 10 No Bids: 1
 For: DISTRICT WAREHOUSE ITB Opening: December 2, 2015
 (School/Department)
 Fund: DEPARTMENT OPERATING BUDGET Advertised Date: November 17, 2014
 Award Amount: \$1,600,000 (CONTRACT TERM)


POSTING OF ITB RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION: ITB Recommendations and Tabulations will be posted in the Procurement & Warehousing Services and www.Demandstar.com on January 13, 2015 @ 3:00 pm, and will remain posted for 72 hours. Any person who is adversely affected by the decision or intended decision shall file a notice of protest, in writing, within 72 hours after the posting of the notice of decision or intended decision. The formal written protest shall be filed within ten (10) days after the date the notice of protest is filed. Failure to file a notice of protest or failure to file a formal written protest shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under this chapter. Section 120.57(3)(b), Florida Statutes, states that "The formal written protest shall state with particularity the facts and law upon which the protest is based." Saturdays, Sundays, state holidays and days during which the school district administration is closed shall be excluded in the computation of the 72-hour time period provided. Filings shall be at the office of the Director of Procurement & Warehousing Services, 7720 West Oakland Park Boulevard, Suite 323, Sunrise, Florida 33351. Any person who files an action protesting an intended decision shall post with the School Board, at the time of filing the formal written protest, a bond, payable to The School Board of Broward County, Florida, (SBBC), in an amount equal to one percent (1%) of the estimated value of the contract. Failure to post the bond required by SBBC Policy 3320, Part VIII, Purchasing Policies, Section N, within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of the right to protest.

(*) The Cone of Silence, as stated in the ITB, is in effect until this bid is approved by SBBC. The School Board meeting date stated above is a tentative date. Confirm with the Purchasing Agent of record for the actual date the Cone of Silence has concluded.

REVISED RECOMMENDATION/TABULATION

<u>VENDOR'S NAME</u>	<u>ITEM(S) AWARDED</u>
Calico Industries	Item 2 – Option A Item 2 – Option B Item 3 – Option A Item 3 – Option B
Interboro Packaging Corporation	Item 1A – Option A Item 1B – Option A
Morven Industries, Inc.	Item 1A – Option B Item 1B – Option B

CONTRACT PERIOD: FEBRUARY 19, 2015 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2017

By:  Date: January 12, 2015
 (Purchasing Agent)

The School Board of Broward County, Florida, prohibits any policy or procedure which results in discrimination on the basis of age, color, disability, gender expression, national origin, marital status, race, religion, sex or sexual orientation. Individuals who wish to file a discrimination complaint, may call the Executive Director, Benefits & EEO Compliance at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

Individuals with disabilities requesting accommodations under the Americans with Disabilities Act (ADA) may call the Equal Educational Opportunities (EEO) at 754-321-2150 or Teletype Machine (TTY) at 754-321-2158.

THE SCHOOL BOARD OF BROWARD COUNTY, FLORIDA BID TABULATION SHEET																	
Item	Description	Quantity	Unit	INTERBORO PACKAGING CORP. NY			MORVEN INDUSTRIES INC.			REX CHEMICAL CORP. ALTERNATE 1			UNIPAK CORP. NY				
				Unit Price	Extension	5% Pref Price	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	Unit Price	Extension	5% Pref Unit Price	Pref Price Extension	
1A	Can Liner, Light Duty, 10 Gallons, Flat Seal-Option A	25,000	case	\$ 16.98	\$424,500.00	\$ 17.83	\$445,725.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 45.00	\$ 1,125,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
1A	Can Liner, Light Duty, 10 Gallons, Flat Seal-Option B	25,000	case	\$ 14.48	\$362,000.00	\$ 15.20	\$380,100.00	\$ 14.34	\$356,500.00	\$ 21.72	\$ 543,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 16.80	\$420,000.00	NO BID	\$441,000.00
1B	Can Liner, Light Duty, 10 Gallons, Star Seal-Option A	25,000	case	\$ 16.48	\$412,000.00	\$ 17.30	\$432,600.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
1B	Can Liner, Light Duty, 10 Gallons, Star Seal-Option B	25,000	case	\$ 13.98	\$349,500.00	\$ 14.68	\$366,975.00	\$ 14.34	\$358,500.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$425,250.00
2	Can Liner, Medium Duty, 33 Gallons, Flat Seal-Option A	4,000	case	\$ 40.82	\$163,280.00	\$ 42.96	\$171,444.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 49.00	\$ 196,000.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
2	Can Liner, Medium Duty, 33 Gallons, Flat Seal-Option B	4,000	case	\$ 36.34	\$145,360.00	\$ 38.16	\$152,628.00	\$ 35.64	\$142,560.00	\$ 25.35	\$ 101,400.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 33.90	\$135,600.00	NO BID	\$142,380.00
3	Compactor Bags-Option A	2,400	case	\$ 23.84	\$57,216.00	\$ 25.03	\$60,076.80	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 67.00	\$ 160,800.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
3	Compactor Bags-Option B	2,400	case	\$ 21.74	\$52,176.00	\$ 22.83	\$54,784.80	\$ 21.45	\$ 51,480.00	\$ 35.07	\$ 84,168.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 18.85	\$ 45,240.00	NO BID	\$ 47,502.00

BID REJECTION SHEET

15-077B - Can Liner and Compactor Bags

Aleph Industries:

Reject Aleph Industries bid for failure to submit with their bid "The Legal Opinion of Bidder's Preference Form," per Section 3, General Conditions 1(d). "Failure to submit and execute this form, with the bid, shall result in bid being considered "non-responsive" and bid rejected."

Rex Chemical Corporation:

Reject bid from this vendor for Item No. 2 (Can Liner, Medium Duty, 33 Gallons, Flat Seal-Option) for failure to meet the bid specifications. The bid specifications required packaging of 250 bags per case +/- 55, with a case weight of 43 lbs. Rex Chemical provided a product with packaging of 100 bags per case and a case weight of 17.6 lbs.